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“Kid, you’ll move mountains! 
Today is your day! Your 
mountain is waiting. So get 
on your way!”

 “You have brains in your 
head. You have feet in your 
shoes. You can steer 
yourself, any direction you 
choose.”

“Think and wonder, wonder 
and think.” 

“A person’s a 
person, no matter 
how small.” 
 

“Don’t cry because it’s 
over. Smile because it 
happened.” 
 

“I like nonsense. It wakes 
up the brain cells.” 

“Why fit in when you were 
born to stand out?” 
 

“The more that you read, 
the more things you will 
know. The more that you 
learn, the more places 
you’ll go."

“Step with care and great 
tact, and remember that 
life’s a great balancing 
act.” 

“You’ll miss the best 
things if you keep your 
eyes shut.” 

“From there to here, from 
here to there, funny things 
are everywhere.”

“I know it is wet and the 
sun is not sunny, but we 
can have lots of good 
fun that is funny.” 

 “If you never did you 
should. These things are 
fun and fun is good.”  
 

“So, open your mouth, 
lad! For every voice 
counts!"

“Unless someone like you 
cares a whole awful lot, 
nothing is going to get 
better. It’s not.”

“Sometimes the 
questions are 
complicated and the 
answers are simple.”

“Fantasy is a necessary 
ingredient in living.”

“Today was good. Today 
was fun. Tomorrow is 
another one."

“You have to be odd to 
be number one.”  

“It’s not about what it is. 
It’s about what it can 
become.” 

“To the world you 
may be one person; 
but to one person you 
may be the world.”

“You are you. Now, 
isn't that pleasant?”

“Everything stinks till it’s 
finished.”


